
From: Pamplin, David (FHWA)
To: "Fick, Debra (DOT)"; Riesenberg, Kris (FHWA)
Cc: Whyte, Masha CTR (FHWA)
Subject: RE: 100% Waiver request for Solicitation Clear Roads Pooled Fund Posting
Date: Tuesday, August 02, 2016 3:11:00 PM
Attachments: 100% Request for Funds_Clear Roads.doc
Importance: High

Ok thanks…I will add the solicitation number to your Waiver Request Letter.
 
We will get this started through the process…it takes two to three weeks and we will
e-mail the approved Waiver Letter to you.
 
Masha…Please start this new waiver request through the process, the solicitation #
1437, and the Waiver Request Letter is attached.  The Division office approval is in
this e-mail chain.
 
Thanks,
 
David
 

David N. Pamplin
Research Pooled Fund Program Manager
Office of Corporate Research & Technology
Federal Highway Administration
Turner-Fairbank Research Center
6300 Georgetown Pike
McLean, VA 22101
(202) 493-3166 (Voice)
 
 
From: Fick, Debra (DOT) [mailto:deb.fick@state.mn.us] 
Sent: Tuesday, August 02, 2016 2:52 PM
To: Pamplin, David (FHWA); Riesenberg, Kris (FHWA); FHWA Pooled Fund
Subject: RE: 100% Waiver request for Solicitation Clear Roads Pooled Fund Posting
 
I just posted it.  It is Sol. #1437
 
Deb Fick
651.366.3759
 
From: Pamplin, David (FHWA) [mailto:david.pamplin@dot.gov] 
Sent: Tuesday, August 02, 2016 1:47 PM
To: Fick, Debra (DOT); Riesenberg, Kris (FHWA); FHWA Pooled Fund
Subject: RE: 100% Waiver request for Solicitation Clear Roads Pooled Fund Posting
Importance: High
 
Chris and Debra….
 
Has this solicitation been posted to the Pooled Fund Website yet?  The solicitation
number that is automatically generated by the website when a solicitation is posted

mailto:deb.fick@state.mn.us
mailto:Kris.Riesenberg@dot.gov
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Minnesota Department of Transportation


Office of Transportation System Management
 


Office Tel:  651-366-3759

Research Services and Library





Office Fax: 651-366-3789


395 John Ireland Boulevard MS 330



   


Saint Paul, MN 55155




August 2, 2016

Mr. Kris Riesenberg


FHWA Minnesota Division


380 Jackson St., Suite 500


St. Paul, MN   55101


Subject:
 Request for use of 100% SP & R Funds


Dear Mr. Reisenberg:

The Minnesota Department of Transportation requests approval to use 100% SP & R Funds for the following Minnesota Lead project/solicitation.  

New Project Solicitation – #1437


Clear Roads Phase II

This new solicitation is the second phase of the current Pooled Fund TPF-5(218).  This new phase of Clear Roads Pooled Fund will address both operational and management research needs, investigating the most effective tools and practices for clearing snow and ice and for managing program resources, budgets and performance measures. It will also include an even stronger emphasis on promoting the use of the research results in the field. The project will provide expanded support for implementation and technology transfer through the development of user manuals, training modules, peer exchanges, and quick turnaround syntheses of the most effective state practices from around the country. This new phase will also include expanded collaboration with other research organizations focused on winter maintenance (such as the Aurora Pooled Fund) to further leverage the research funding investment.

Enclosed for your review is a copy of the complete proposal.  Thank you for your consideration of this request and we look forward to your favorable concurrence.  


If you have any questions, please contact Deb Fick at (651) 366-3759 or deb.fick@dot.state.mn.us

Sincerely,


Linda K Taylor, PE


Director, Mn/DOT Research Services and Library

Cc:  Tom Peters, MnDOT Office of Maintenance


       Greg Waidley,  CTC & Associates 

LKT/df


An Equal Opportunity Employer
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needs to be on the Waiver Request letter to identify which new solicitation/project you
are requesting a waiver for.
 
Thanks,
 
David
 

David N. Pamplin
Research Pooled Fund Program Manager
Office of Corporate Research & Technology
Federal Highway Administration
Turner-Fairbank Research Center
6300 Georgetown Pike
McLean, VA 22101
(202) 493-3166 (Voice)
 
From: Fick, Debra (DOT) [mailto:deb.fick@state.mn.us] 
Sent: Tuesday, August 02, 2016 2:28 PM
To: Riesenberg, Kris (FHWA); FHWA Pooled Fund
Cc: Pamplin, David (FHWA)
Subject: RE: 100% Waiver request for Solicitation Clear Roads Pooled Fund Posting
 
Kris--\
Here is the official 100% request letter---
 
Deb Fick
651.366.3759
 
From: Riesenberg, Kris (FHWA) [mailto:Kris.Riesenberg@dot.gov] 
Sent: Tuesday, August 02, 2016 1:23 PM
To: FHWA Pooled Fund
Cc: Fick, Debra (DOT); Pamplin, David (FHWA)
Subject: 100% Waiver request for Solicitation Clear Roads Pooled Fund Posting
 
Hi David,
Attached is a Clear Roads pooled fund research study solicitation.  The State has requested a waiver
from the SP&R match requirement.  The Division concurs with the request.
Please let me know if you have questions or comments or additional information is needed.
Thanks,
Kris
 
Kris Riesenberg
FHWA Minnesota Division
Technical Services Team Leader
380 Jackson St. Suite 500
St. Paul, MN 55101
 
(651) 291-6114
kris.riesenberg@dot.gov
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From: Fick, Debra (DOT) [mailto:deb.fick@state.mn.us] 
Sent: Tuesday, August 02, 2016 1:04 PM
To: Riesenberg, Kris (FHWA)
Subject: RE: Clear Roads Pooled Fund Posting
 
Ok.  Here it is---
 
Deb Fick
651.366.3759
 
From: Riesenberg, Kris (FHWA) [mailto:Kris.Riesenberg@dot.gov] 
Sent: Tuesday, August 02, 2016 12:49 PM
To: Fick, Debra (DOT)
Subject: RE: Clear Roads Pooled Fund Posting
 
Let me complete my review prior to posting it, and you can post it while it is under review by my HQ.
 

From: Fick, Debra (DOT) [mailto:deb.fick@state.mn.us] 
Sent: Tuesday, August 02, 2016 11:43 AM
To: Riesenberg, Kris (FHWA)
Subject: Clear Roads Pooled Fund Posting
 
Hi Kris---
We have put together a solicitation proposal for Clear Roads II.  Can I post this concurrently with getting
approval for 100% waiver or do you want to see the proposal first and approve that prior to posting---
 
Deb Fick
SP & R Program Coordinator
MN Office of Transportation System Management
395 John Ireland Blvd, MS 440
St. Paul, MN  55155
 
deb.fick@state.mn.us
651.366.3759
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